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MINUTES OF AN ADJOURNED REGULAR 
MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF 
THE arTY OF TORRANCE 

Te>rrance. California 
August 20, 1940 

The City aouncil of the City of Torrance convened in an 
Adjourned Regular Meeting in the Council Ohamber, City Hall, 
Torrance, California, on Tuesday, August 20, 1940 at 5:00 P.M. 

Mayor McGuire called the meeting to o~er. 

Clerk Bartlett called the roll, those answering present being 
Councilmen~ Babcock, Hitchcock, Murray and McGuire. Absent; 
Oounoilmell: P-owell. 

Be1~ an adjOurned meeting, the regular order of bus1ness waa 
dispensed with. 

At 5:0B P.M. Clerk Bartlett opened sealed bids for 2500 feet of 
pipe as follows: 

Bidder 

American Cast Iron PIpe CO. 
412 West 6th Street 
Los Angeles, California 

Bid 

(al Coal Tar Lined $ 1.998 $ 4,980.00 
(b) Cement LIned 1.992 4,960.00 

Bid Bond for $600.00 aocompanied bid •. 

United States Pipe & 
Foundry Co. 
448 South Hill Street 
Los Angeles, California 

(a) Coal Tar Lined 
(b} Cement Lined 

$ 1.974 $ 4,935.00 
1.974 4,935.00 

B1d Bond for $600.00 aooompanied bid. 

Grinnell Company of the 
Pacific 
520 Mat,eo Street 
Los Angeles, California 

-
(a) Coal Tar Lined *"1.95 $ 4,875.00 
(b} Enameline Lined 1.95 4,875.00 

A oertif1ed Cheok for ~.oo acoompanied bid. 

Johns..-Manv111e 

m~ IirG.e\gJ~ 8J'rrpJrn1& 
An unoffioial bid oovering 
12" Class 150 Transite Pipe. 

epose

epose



Counoilman Hitchcock moved that a reoess be deolared until the 
City Counoil as a whole, the Acting City Engineer and the Manager 
of the Water Department oonsider the bids. Counoilman Murray secoIld­
ed the motion, which was carried unanimously. 

The meeting reoonvened at 5:12 P.M. 

Counoilman Hitchcock moved that the bid of Grinnell Company of 
the Pacific for 2500 feet of Cast Iron Pipe for $4,875.00 be acoepted 
and all other bids be rejeoted. Counoilman Babcock seconded the 
motion, which was carried by the following roll call vote: AYES: 
COUNCILMEN: Babocaic, Hitchoock, Murray and MoGuire. NCBS: COUNCIL­
MEN: NOne. ABSENT: COUNCILMEN: Powell. 

A oommunioa~ion was read trom Arthur C. Palmer requesting per­
miSSion to install a small experime.ntal laboratory at 1817 _ 2l3th 
Street, which would be free from dust or fumes. 

Councilman Hitchcook moved the request be granted. Councilman 
BabcoCk seconded the motton, whioh was carried unanimously. 

Clerk Bartlett presented tor tinal reading: 

ORC[NANCE NO. 3lt 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE. CITY OF '!ORRANCE 
FIXING THE TAX RATES AND LEVYING TAXES 
FOR THE FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING JULY 1, 
1940. 

Counoilman Hitchcock moved that further reading 01' Ordinance 
No. 319 be d1spensed with. Counoilman Baboook seoonded the motion, 
which was oarried-unanimous1y. 

Councilman Hitchcock moved that Ordinanoe No. 319 be adopted 
for final reading. Councilman Babcock seconded the motion, 1b ioh 
was oarried by the folloWing roll eall vote:.· AYES: COUNCILMEN: 
Baboock, H1thcock, Murray, and MoGuire. NOES: COUNCILMEN: None. 
ABSENT: COUNCILMEN: Powell. 

Counoilman Hitchoock moved that an appzopriation of $63.00 be 
made tor motor exohange in City Truok No.8. C0UDcilman Babcack 
seoonded the motion, whioh was oarried by the tollowing roll 08011 
vote: A.lES: COUNCILMEN: Baboook, Hitohoook, Murray and McGuire. 
NOllS: COUNCILMEN: None. ABSENT: COUNCILMEN: t>owell. 

Action on the application of ernl CraW1"ord, 2107 Lom1 ta 
Bou].evard, Lomita, tor permit to opera.te billiard room at 1650 
Cabrillo, referred to the Police COmmission for recommendation at 
this time, was deterred until the return of Councilman Powell, 
Chairman of the Polioe Commission, who is on vacation. 

Acting C1ty Engineer Jain reported that Victor Wade had been 
employed to work in the Engineering Department. 

<RAL COMMUNICATIONS 

No oral communioations. 

Counoilman tlitchcock moved all bills properly audited be paid. 
Councilman Babcock seconded the motion, which was carried by the 
following roll~all vote: A.YES: COUNCILMEN: Babcoek, Hitchcock, 
Murray and MoGuire. NOES: COUNCILMll:N: None. ABSENT: COUNCILMEN: 
Powell. 
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At 5:23 P.M., upon motion of Counoilman H1tchcoc'k, seconded by 
COuncilJ:nan Murray, the meeting adjourned to August 26, 1940 at 5:00 
P.M. 

Approved: 
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MINUTES OF AN ADJOURNED RmULAlt 
MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF 
THE CITY OF TORRANCE 

Torranoe, California 
August 26, 1940 

The City Council of the City of Torrance gonvened in an 
Adjourned Regular Meeting in the Council Chamber, City Hall, 
Torrance, California, on Monday, August 26, 1940 at 5:00 P.M. 

Mayor McGuire called the meet~ng to order. 

Clerk Bartlett called the roll, those answering presen" 
being CounoilJ:nen: Babcook, Hi tchco;ck, Murray ~d McGuire. A"s.nt~ 
Councilmen: Ponll. 

Being an adjourned meeting, th~ regular order of business 
was d1 spensed 111. th. 

At 5:01 P.M. Clerk. Bartlett opened sealed bids for Water 
Department Materials as follows: 

Bidder 

Gr1nnell Co~any of 
the Pacific 
520 Mateo Street 
Los Angeles, California 

~ 

Section 1 t 
Section 2 
Section 3 
Section 4 

552.54 
949.46 
No bid 
No bid 

Less ~ - 10 days. A certified check for $155.00 accompanied bid. 

Commercial Iron Works 
2424 Porter Street 
Los Angeles, California 

seetion 1 $ 
sect10n 2-
Section 3 
Section 4 

554.31 
930.60 
No bid 
No bid 

2<f, except. lead ~ 2% 30 days. No Bidder's Bond nor Cert1tied cheek 
accompanied bid. 

Charles P. Crowley 
609 S. Anderson St. 
Los Angeles, California 

section 1 
Section 2 
Sect10n 3 
Section 4 

$ No bid 
No bid 

1111.40 
550.00 

No discount. No B1dder's Bond nor Cert1t1ed check accompanied bid. 
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