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Torrance, California
August 26, 1940

MINUTES OF AN ADJOURNED REGULAR
MEETING OF THE CITY CQUNCIL OF
THE CITY OF TORRANCE

The City Council of the City of Torrance convened in an
Ad Journed Regular Meeting in the Council Chamber, City Hall,
Torrance, California, on Monday, August 26, 1940 at 5:00 P.M.

Mayor McGuire called the meeting to order.

Clerk Bartlett called the roll, those answering present
being Councilmen: Babecack, Hitcheack, Murray and MeGuire. Absent!?
Councilmen: Powell,

Being an ad journed meeting, the regular order of business
was dispensed with.

At 5:01 P.M, Clerk Bartlett opened sealed bids for Water
Department Materials as follows:

Bidder ' Bid
Grinnell Company of Section 1 § 552.54
the Pacifiec Section 2 949 .46
520 Mateo Street Seetion 3 No bid
Los Angeles, Celifornia Section 4 No bid

Less 24 - 10 days. A eertified cheek for $155.00 accompanied bid,

Commercial Iron Works Séeetion 1 $ 554.31
2424 Portier Street Section 2 930.60
Los Angeles, California . Seetion 3 No bid

Section 4 No bid

2% except lead -~ 2% 30 days. No Bidder's Bond nor Certified check
acecompanied bid.

Charles P. Crowley Seetion 1 § No bid
609 S, Anderson St. Section 2 No bid
Los Angeles, Celifornia Section 3 1111.40

Section 4 550,00

No discount. No Bidder's Bond nor Certified check accompanied bid.
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Bidder Bid
Renesseleer Valve Company Seetion 1 $ No bia
Subway Terminal Bldg. Section 2 1015.46
Los Angeles, California Seetion 3 No bid

Section 4 No bid

2% - 30 days. Certified Check for $200.00 accompanied bid.

Howard Supply Company Seetion 1 $ No bid
5125 Santa Fe Avenue Section 2 475.30
Los Angeles, Californisa Section 3 975.00
Alternate Section 3 825.00

Section 4 No bid

2% - 30 dajs. Cashier's Cheek for $150.00 aceompanied bid,

Deyton & Waldrip Co. - Section 1 ¢ 383.88
Hollywood - Section 2 No bid
California Seetion 3 No bid

Section 4 No bid
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2% - 10 days. No Bidder's Bond nor Certified check accompanied bid.

Clayton Mfg. Company Seetion 1 $ No bid
Alhambra Section 2 No bid
California Section 3 803.40

2% - 30 days. Cashier's Check for $85.00 accompanied bid.

R. W. Sparling Section 1 § No bvid
945 North Main St. Sestion 2 No bid
Los Angeles, California Section 3 No bid

Section 4 653,20
Less 1%. Certified Check for $70.00 accompenied bid.,

Chas. M. Bailey Co. Inec. Section 1 $ No bid
2376 East 5lst Street Seetion 2 No bid
Los Angeles, California Seetion 3 975,00
Alternate Section 3 825,00

Section 4 No bid

2% - 30 days. Cashier's Check for $87.50 accompanied bid.

Water Works Supply Company Section 1 § No bid
417 S. Hill Street Section 2 966,00
Low Angeles, California Section 3 No bid

Seetion 4 No bid

No discount. Bidder's Bond for $100.00 accompanied bid.

Rich Menufacturing Co. Section 1 § No bid
3851 Santa Fe Avenue Section 2 719 .46
Los Angeles, California Seetion 3 No bid

. Section 4 No bid

No discount, Certified Check for $71.95 accompanied bid.




Councilman Hitchcock moved that the :bid of Crane Company be
rejected. and returned unopened for the reason that said bid was
received at 5:35 P.M., too late to comply with the instructions
set forth in "Instruetions to Bidder". Councilman Murray seconded
the motion, which was carried unanimously.

Councilmen Hitchcock moved all bids be weferred to the City
Council a&s a whole, the Acting City Engineer and the Manager of
the Water Department for ;consideration and report at the next
meeting. Councilman Babcock seconded the motion, which was
carried unenimously.

Councilman Hitehcock moved that the members of the City Council
and other City employees epproved by the City Council, be authorized
to attend the State Convention of the league of Califormia Cities
on September 16, 17, 18 and 19, 1940 at San Diego, expenses paid.,
Councilmen Murray aeconded the motion, which was carried by the
following roll e¢all vote, AYES: COUNCILMEN: Babcock, Hitcheocek,
gurrig and MeGuire. NOES: COUNCILMEN: None. ABSENT: COUNCILMEN:

OW .

At 5:30 P.M., upon motion of Councilmen Hitohcock, seconded by
Councilman Murray, the meeting adjourned.
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